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SUPPLIED IN CONFIDENCE TO THE NSW I.C.A.C.

[Service NSW 2021 COVID-19 Micro Business Grant]
‘Retrospective Clawback and Extortion Scam’

[2022 - present]

¢

Witness Personal Account and Victim Impact Statement
[Complainant #16]

The following written evidence received from Steven Ridd by email to steve@naturetrail.com.au .

[Emails (most recent at top)]

START OF EVIDENCE

*

Date: Thu, 19 Sept 2024, 10:58 am
Subject: Covid grant claw back harrasment
To: <nswombo@ombo.nsw.gov.au>

Hello,
| write this respectfully under duress.

For over a year since April 2023 I've had multiple back and forth emails and calls, including a letter of
demand for payment from Service NSW and state debt recovery.

Both accountants have given clear information on my eligibility for Micro business grant.
My business is still suffering I'm barely coping emotionally, physically and professionally.

I've given info that was requested, | was approved and paid..
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| was informed if | did not pay by August 15th they confiscate my possessions.

I've had at least 5 people email with no visible information in front of them, I've given proof of my
earnings that had declined by at least 50%.

| have 3 different case or reference numbers.
They've asked different time frames, dates etc minimal consistency.
Continued to ask me to do their work they are vague and seem lost themselves.

My stress is on overload | can't do this any longer, | need help or | see no point anything anymore |
done get to $50,000 per year.

rrom:

Sent: Tuesday, 17 September 2024 5:16 AM

Cc: steve@naturetrail.com.au;

Omg hello group,

I've not replied on here as the anxiety is just overwhelming as you all can relate.

My mind is always on overload so when | write or txt it can be rather messy,that's because my fingers
can't keep up with my mind.

Anyway I'll get to the point...

During locking isolated as a single person in a unit, not pets either, fear for the future, life and this
worlds safety didn't allow a clear mind for very many, so whilst filling out my CG application the only
thing | added which may have been an issue was a part of Excel work sheet ( should not have done
so) other than that it was all very clear that | was well within the percentage of what entitled me to
the support. I've also had multiple case workers with their scripted emails, a debt rev letter
demanding | pay by August 18th in desperation to be left alone | rang asking for information and
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stating that | had nothing to pay with they informed me they'd come and take my
belongings/possessions. | informed them that I'd filled out the form honestly then the guy on phone
put me on hold came back to let me know that they had missed the fact that it was now on hold till

October 15th @

I'm ready to email them with the very simple and point form facts and advise I'm going to
Ombudsman and media but procrastinating out of fear of the result as they don't seem to care...

*

From: Service NSW Customer Support <customersupport@service.nsw.gov.au>
Date: Wed, 4 Sept 2024, 1:21 pm
Subject: Re: Review on grant application for MB Support Grant 21 - Application for-

oear I

As you are aware, the outcome of your Internal Review is due on 15 August 2024. However, we are
writing to advise that there will be a delay in providing the outcome of your Internal Review.

We are currently prioritising your request and are aiming to provide you with a
response as soon as possible.

We apologise for an inconvenience to you as a result of this delay.
We appreciate your understanding in this matter.

Sincerely,

Craig

Customer Payments Support team - Internal Reviews

On behalf of Director of Customer Payments

Service NSW
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T137788

From:
Sent: 23/7/2024, 3:53 pm
To: customersupport@service.nsw.gov.au

Subject: Re: Dispute Internal Review [ ref_]

[CAUTION: This email originated from outside of the organisation. Do not click links or open
attachments unless you recognise the sender and know the content is safe.]

Is anyone reading my replies here?
I've had no response.

Application approved by NSW Service of $10,000.

Thank you.

However, my application should legally be available to you and myself.
Service NSW will not allow me access which is in breach of my human rights.

So | will be needing it and an explanation as to how it was approved by you when | had put my trust
in the government helping us whilst we had been immorally isolated from others including work.

On Wed, 17 July 2024, 12:55 pm Service NSW Customer Support,
<customersupport@service.nsw.gov.au> wrote:

oear I

Thank you for your email.
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Unfortunately, | am unable to provide a copy of the application. However, | have arranged for the
Business Customer Resolutions Team to contact you regarding your request.

Please note that during your previous audit compliance review, it was determined that you did not
meet the eligibility criteria based on your total business income for the fiscal year ending June 30,

2020, which was $-

According to the guidelines for the Micro Business Grant:
3. Eligibility criteria
3.1 Businesses and not-for-profit organizations impacted by the Public Health Order will be eligible if:

e They had an aggregated annual turnover of more than $30,000 and less than $75,000 for the
year ended June 30, 2020.

If you have any further documentation or additional information you would like to be considered in
your dispute, please provide it at your earliest convenience.

| have also attached Micro Business Guidelines and Terms and Conditions for your own records.
Sincerely,

Linda

Customer Payments Support team - Internal Reviews

On behalf of Director of Customer Payments

Service NSW
T1377 88

From:
Sent: Friday, 26 July 2024 5:30 AM

To: steve@naturetrail.com.au

Subject: Fwd: Service NSW Programme - Reference Number_

Hi Steve,

I'm away today, but may be able to get a call through this afternoon otherwise Monday if that's ok?
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I'm sitting down Sunday going back through all notes, emails, paperwork etc
The above email you'll see is stating on hold till October 17th.
My brain hurts but I'm not giving up.

Was reading through all your links, last night & missed your call, sorry about that. | have a lot of
writing to pin point discrepancies.

Another confusion is the amounts... | was under the impression Micro was 10,000 not varied
amounts ???

Cheers-.

rrom:

Sent: Tuesday, 23 July 2024 1:52 PM
To: steve@naturetrail.com.au

Subject: -
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rrom:

Sent: Saturday, 13 July 2024 4:12 PM
To: steve@naturetrail.com.au

Subject: -

Hi Steve,

Thanks for chatting with me today, it is greatly appreciated ‘

*
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rrom:

Sent: Tuesday, 9 July 2024 7:33 PM
To: steve@naturetrail.com.au
Subject: Micro grant harraseee

Hi Steve,
| have been given your details by_
Sadly it all got too much for her and she paid and is struggling to even talk about it.

So | also received $10,000 for Micro business and have been harrased since last year! I'd given
everything asked and assumed since the last email we have all we need that, that was the end of it
until 3 weeks ago.

I'm so overwhelmed and confused about how to approach this....

I've read through your info from ., and even more confused as | believe you received a different
amount to ? Micro was 10,000 clear on my bank statement, however in the Service NSW site they
state | received $12,000...

| also am unable to pull up application, was also told by them last year that they also are unable to
pull it up as it had been completed and filed.

I'm not great in email and stressed so I'm off to bed (early riser)
I would be so grateful for some support / advise if that is OK with you... ?
| have another 9am phone call with them this Friday.

My contact details are

I'm free either tomorrow before 11am or Thursday.
Also congratulations on your win Q 6 @ @

*

End of supplied evidence
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This document submitted by Steven Ridd, Managing Director, Wistmans Wood Holdings Pty Limited [ACN 600

331 931] as trustee for Wistmans Wood Trust [ABN 51 965 308 493 ] trading as Nature Trail. Registered Address:
5 Kundibar Street KATOOMBA NSW 2780.]

By email icac@icac.nsw.gov.au

Level 7, 255 Elizabeth Street
Sydney, New South Wales
Australia
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